
 
August 9, 2006

STAR GAS PARTNERS, L.P. REPORTS FISCAL 2006 THIRD QUARTER RESULTS

STAMFORD, CT (August 9, 2006) -- Star Gas Partners, L.P. (the "Partnership" or "Star") (NYSE: SGU), a home energy 
distributor and services provider specializing in heating oil, today announced financial results for its fiscal 2006 third quarter, 
and the nine-month period ended June 30, 2006. On December 17, 2004, the Partnership sold its propane segment and the 
historical results of the propane segment are accounted for as discontinued operations in the Partnership's financial 
statements. On April 28, 2006, the Partnership completed its previously announced recapitalization in which $57.7 million in 
equity was raised, $65.3 million in debt was repaid and $26.9 million in debt was converted into common equity. 

For the fiscal 2006 third quarter, Star reported a 5.6 percent decrease in total revenues to $191.5 million, compared to total 
revenues of $202.8 million in the year ago period, as a reduction in volume of home heating oil more than offset the impact of 
higher selling prices. The home heating oil volume decline was due to 22.3 percent warmer temperatures, net customer attrition 
and other factors. Selling prices were higher due to the increase in the wholesale cost of home heating oil and the 
Partnership's more disciplined pricing strategy. Average wholesale home heating oil product costs increased 32.9 percent to 
$1.90 per gallon for the fiscal 2006 third quarter, compared to $1.43 for the prior year period. Home heating oil volume for the 
fiscal 2006 third quarter declined 30.1 percent, year-over-year, from 65.8 million gallons to 46.0 million gallons.  

For the fiscal 2006 third quarter, Star lost approximately 5,800 accounts (net), or 1.3 percent of its home heating oil customer 
base, as compared to the fiscal 2005 third quarter in which Star lost 7,400 accounts (net), or 1.5 percent of its home heating oil 
customer base. For the twelve months ended June 30, 2006, Star's net customer attrition rate was 8.3 percent, which 
compares to 7.1 percent, 6.4 percent and 1.5 percent for fiscal 2005, fiscal 2004 and fiscal 2003, respectively. The Partnership 
expects that home heating oil volume sold for the remainder of fiscal 2006 will be less than in the comparable period in fiscal 
2005 due to net customer attrition. 

Home heating oil per gallon margins for the fiscal 2006 third quarter rose by 10.4 cents per gallon, versus the corresponding 
fiscal 2005 period due largely to an increase in the margins realized on sales to price-protected customers when compared to 
the margins experienced during the fiscal 2005 third quarter and the Partnership's decision in the fourth quarter of fiscal 2005 
and continuing into fiscal 2006 to maintain reasonable profit margins on both variable and price-protected customers in spite of 
competitors' aggressive pricing tactics. Star does not expect to achieve a comparable increase in per gallon margins for the 
remainder of fiscal 2006. 

The service results improved by $1.3 million from a profit of $0.4 million (0.6 cents per gallon) for the fiscal 2005 third quarter, 
to a $1.7 million profit (3.6 cents per gallon) for the fiscal 2006 third quarter. 

Total operating expenses (delivery, branch, general and administrative) decreased by $3.7 million, or 6.8 percent, to $51.4 
million for the fiscal 2006 third quarter, as compared to $55.1 million for the prior year's quarter. Operating expenses were 
favorably impacted by an estimated $3.3 million decrease in certain variable operating expenses related to the decline in home 
heating oil volume, a reduction in marketing expenses of $0.7 million and a decline in certain expenses incurred in the fiscal 
2005 third quarter such as $1.4 million for first year compliance with Sarbanes-Oxley and severance costs of $0.6 million, which 
were not repeated during the third quarter of fiscal 2006. Insurance expense for the fiscal 2006 quarter was higher by $3.2 
million than the prior year's comparable period largely due to the adverse adjudication of two large worker's compensation 
claims. 

In the fiscal 2006 third quarter, the operating loss increased by $0.9 million to a $24.3 million loss, as compared to an operating 
loss of $23.4 million for the fiscal 2005 third quarter, as the reduction in total operating costs (including depreciation and 
amortization) of $7.3 million and increase in net service profitability of $1.3 million were more than offset by a decrease in 
product gross profit of $6.2 million and an increase in insurance expense of $3.2 million. 

For the fiscal 2006 third quarter, interest expense decreased $3.0 million to $5.8 million, as compared to $8.8 million for the 
fiscal 2005 third quarter due to a lower principal amount in total debt outstanding of approximately $148.8 million. Total debt 
declined due to the recapitalization and lower working capital borrowings. 

For the three months ended June 30, 2006, the net loss increased by $6.8 million, to a $36.1 million loss, compared to a net 
loss of $29.3 million for the three months ended June 30, 2005, as a reduction in net interest expense of $3.2 million was more 



than offset by the increase in the operating loss of $0.9 million, a $6.6 million net charge recorded on the early redemption 
($65.3 million) and conversion into equity ($26.9 million) of the Partnership's 10.25% senior notes, and a change in income 
taxes of $2.9 million. During the fiscal 2006 third quarter, the Partnership recorded an income tax expense of $0.5 million, as 
compared to a $2.4 million benefit recorded in the fiscal 2005 third quarter. 

For the three months ended June 30, 2006, EBITDA loss increased $7.8 million to $22.5 million, as compared to an EBITDA 
loss of $14.7 million for the three months ended June 30, 2005, as the lower volume resulted in a decline in home heating oil 
gross profit of $11.4 million (of which approximately $7.1 million is weather-related), an increase in insurance expense of $3.2 
million and a $6.6 million charge recorded for early debt redemption more than offset the impact of 10.4 cents per gallon higher 
home heating oil margins ($4.8 million), a reduction in total operating expenses of $6.9 million and an increase in service and 
installation profitability of $1.3 million. EBITDA should not be considered as an alternative to net income (as an indicator of 
operating performance) or as an alternative to cash flow (as a measure of liquidity or ability to service debt obligations), but 
provides additional information for evaluating the Partnership's ability to make the Minimum Quarterly Distribution. The 
Partnership is not required to accrue the Minimum Quarterly Distribution until October 1, 2008. 

Star Gas Partners Chief Executive Officer Joseph Cavanaugh, stated, "Our fiscal 2006 third quarter results reflect the impact of 
warmer than normal weather experienced in April and May 2006, continued volatility of oil supply prices and efforts by 
customers to conserve energy in a period of unprecedented high prices. On a positive note, our 1.3 percent attrition rate for 
the quarter was lower than both the 2.2 percent rate in the fiscal second quarter of 2006, as well as the 1.5 percent rate we 
experienced in the year-ago period. We are now able to seek out complementary acquisitions and have a considerably less-
leveraged balance sheet than prior to the completion of the recapitalization." 

For the nine-month period ended June 30, 2006, Star achieved a 3.3 percent increase in revenues to $1,145.0 million, 
compared to $1,108.8 million in the corresponding prior-year period as increases in selling prices more than offset a decline in 
product sales due to lower volume. 

During the first nine months of fiscal 2006, home heating oil volume declined 93.3 million gallons, or 20.6 percent, from 453.1 
million gallons to 359.7 million gallons. The home heating oil volume decline was due to 11.6 percent warmer temperatures, net 
customer attrition and other factors. For the nine months ended June 30, 2006, Star lost 22,700 accounts (net), or 5.1 percent 
of its home heating oil customer base, as compared to the nine months ended June 30, 2005 in which Star lost 19,300 
accounts (net), or 3.9 percent of its home heating oil customer base. The principal change in performance was a reduction of 
7,000 new customer gains, partially offset by 3,600 fewer customer losses. The reduction in new customer gains can be 
attributed to: (i) higher minimum profitability standards for new customers in fiscal 2005 and fiscal 2006; (ii) a reduction in mass 
market advertising spending, which attracted transient customers in the past; (iii) continued customer price sensitivity due to 
high energy prices; and (iv) increased new customer credit quality standards. We expect that net customer attrition will continue 
through the balance of fiscal 2006 and perhaps beyond. 

The service results improved by $5.4 million from a loss of $10.3 million (2.3 cents per gallon) for the first nine months of fiscal 
2005 to a loss of $4.9 million (1.4 cents per gallon) for the first nine months of fiscal 2006. 

Home heating oil per gallon margins for the first nine months of fiscal 2006 increased by 13.4 cents versus the corresponding 
period in fiscal 2005, due largely to the increase in margins realized on sales to price protected accounts and an increase in 
the margin realized on variable priced customers. 

Total operating expenses (delivery, branch, general and administrative) decreased by $38.9 million, or 17.7 percent, to $181.1 
million for the first nine months of fiscal 2006. This decrease was due to lower bridge and financing expenses of $10.9 million, a 
$6.1 million reduction in marketing expenses, a $6.1 million reduction in legal and compliance costs, the receipt of $4.4 million 
in weather insurance proceeds (which lowered operating expenses), a decrease in certain variable operating expenses directly 
associated with the 20.6 percent decline in home heating oil volume (estimated to be $7.8 million), $3.8 million lower 
compensation expense related to separation agreements recorded in the first nine months of fiscal 2005 with former executives 
of the Partnership and other expense reductions of $4.4 million. These improvements were reduced by higher director's and 
officer's liability insurance expense of $1.1 million, and $1.4 million of legal and professional expense relating to our exploring 
our financial options. In the fiscal 2005 first quarter, the decline in the unit price for senior subordinated units resulted in 
reversing previously recorded compensation expenses of $2.2 million, which lowered total operating costs in the nine months 
ended June 30, 2005. 

For the nine months ended June 30, 2006, operating income increased by $109.7 million to $47.9 million, as compared to an 
operating loss of $61.8 million for the nine months ended June 30, 2005. This increase was due to an increase in net service 
and installation profitability of $5.4 million, lower delivery, branch and general administrative expenses of $38.9 million, lower 
depreciation and amortization of $2.1 million, and the non-recurrence of a $67.0 million goodwill impairment charge recorded in 
the nine months ended June 30, 2005, reduced by lower product gross profit of $3.7 million. 

For the nine months ended June 30, 2006, net income decreased by $1.0 million to $20.0 million, as compared to $21.0 million 
for the nine months ended June 30, 2005, as an increase in net service and installation profitability of $5.4 million, $38.9 million 



lower operating expenses, a $7.9 million reduction in net interest expense and a $2.1 million decline in depreciation and 
amortization costs were more than offset by a $3.7 million reduction in product gross profit and the positive impact on net 
income ($51.6 million in total) of certain non-routine transactions/events occurring primarily in the nine months ended June 30, 
2005, which had a greater impact than in the nine months ended June 30, 2006. These transactions/events include goodwill 
loss impairment of $67.0 million, change in loss on redemption of debt of $35.5 million, income (loss) attributable to sold 
operations of $151.2 million and the cumulative effect of changes in accounting principle. 

EBITDA for the nine months ended June 30, 2006 increased $143.1 million to $66.1 million, as compared to an EBITDA loss of 
$77.0 million for the nine months ended June 30, 2005. This increase was due to the 13.4 cents increase in home heating oil 
gross profit margins ($48.1 million), a reduction in net service loss of $5.4 million, $38.9 million lower operating expenses, 
reduced in part by the decline in home heating oil gross profit of $51.9 million (of which $27.0 million was weather-related). The 
nine-month comparison was also favorably impacted by a change in loss on redemption of debt of $35.5 million and the non-
recurrence of a $67.0 million goodwill impairment charge recorded in the nine months ended June 30, 2005. EBITDA is a non-
GAAP financial measure (see below reconciliation) that should not be considered as an alternative to net income (as an 
indicator of operating performance) or as an alternative to cash flow (as a measure of liquidity or ability to service debt 
obligations). Management believes this information is of interest to investors as a supplemental measure of the Partnership's 
operating performance and provides additional information for evaluating the Partnership's ability to make the Minimum 
Quarterly Distribution. The Partnership is not required to accrue the Minimum Quarterly Distribution until October 1, 2008. If the 
Partnership elects to commence making distributions of available cash before October 1, 2008, minimum quarterly distributions 
will start accruing at that earlier date. 

REMINDER: Star Gas management will host a conference call and webcast today at 1:00 p.m. (ET). Conference call dial-in is 
800/313-6624 or 415/908-6225 (international callers). A webcast is also available at www.star-gas.com and at www.vcall.com  

Star Gas Partners, L.P., is the nation's largest retail distributor of home heating oil. Additional information is available by 
obtaining the Partnership's SEC filings and by visiting Star's website at www.star-gas.com.  

Forward Looking Information 

This news release includes "forward-looking statements" which represent the Partnership's expectations or beliefs concerning 
future events that involve risks and uncertainties, including those associated with the effect of weather conditions on our 
financial performance; the price and supply of home heating oil; the consumption patterns of our customers; our ability to 
obtain satisfactory gross profit margins; our ability to obtain new customers and retain existing customers; our ability to effect 
strategic acquisitions or redeploy underperforming assets; the impact of litigation; the ongoing impact of the business process 
redesign project at the heating oil segment and our ability to address issues related to that project; natural gas conversions; 
future union relations and the outcome of current and future union negotiations; the impact of current and future 
environmental, health and safety regulations; customer creditworthiness; and marketing plans. All statements other than 
statements of historical facts included in this news release are forward-looking statements. Although the Partnership believes 
that the expectations reflected in such forward-looking statements are reasonable, it can give no assurance that such 
expectations will prove to have been correct. Important factors that could cause actual results to differ materially from the 
Partnership's expectations ("Cautionary Statements") are disclosed in this news release and in the Partnership's Annual Report 
on Form 10-K/A for the year ended September 30, 2005 and its Quarterly Report on Form 10-Q for the fiscal quarter ended 
June 30, 2006, including without limitation and in conjunction with the forward-looking statements included in this news release. 
All subsequent written and oral forward-looking statements attributable to the Partnership or persons acting on its behalf are 
expressly qualified in their entirety by the Cautionary Statements. Unless otherwise required by law, the Partnership undertakes 
no obligation to update or revise any forward-looking statements, whether as a result of new information, future events or 
otherwise after the date of this news release. 

http://www.star-gas.com/
http://www.vcall.com/
http://www.star-gas.com/
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Star Gas Partners 
Investor Relations 
203/328-7310  

Robert Rinderman, Steven Hecht
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